[TO BE PUBLISHED IN THE GAZETTE OF INDIA, EXTRAORDINARY, PART
II, SECTION 3, SUB-SECTION (i)]
Government of India
Ministry of Corporate Affairs
Notification

New Delhi, the 0 7September, 2020,

G.S.R. ___ (E). - In exercise of the powers conferred by section 73 read with
sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 469 of the Companies Act, 2013 (18 of 2013), the
Central Government in consultation with the Reserve Bank of India, hereby makes

the following rules further to amend the Companies (Acceptance of Deposits)

Rules, 2014, namely:-

i A (1) These rules may be called the Companies (Acceptance of Deposits)

Amendment Rules, 2020.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official

Gazette.

2. In the Companies (Acceptance of Deposits) Rules, 2014 (hereinafter referred

to as the said rules), in rule 2, in sub-rule (1), in clause (c), in sub-clause (xvii), -
(i) for the words “five years”, the words “ ten years” shall be substituted;

(ii) in the Explanation, in clause I, for the letters, figures, brackets and words
“G.S.R. 180 (E) dated 17th February, 2016 issued by the Department of Industrial

Policy and Promotion, Ministry of Commerce and Industry”, the letters, figures,




brackets and words “G.S.R. 127 (E), dated the 19th February, 2019 issued by the

Department for Promotion of Industry and Internal Trade “ shall be substituted.

| In the said rules, in rule 3, in sub-rule (3), in the second proviso, in clause

(i), for the words “five years”, the words, “ten years” shall be substituted.

[File No 1/8/2013- CL-V Vol VI]

[/‘«Fjr-
KV ?/I?Jl?y)bu

Joint Secretary to the Government of India

Note. - The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary,
Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide number G.S.R. 256(E), dated the 315t March,
2014 and were last amended vide notification number G.S.R. 341(E), dated the 30t
April, 2019.




[T & TSYH, HHYROT, HET 2, @S 3, 39@s (i) # T

T TIER
FRINT FT FA@T

I
a5 feedhl, o7/ Rawey, 2020

aranfa. L (31).- T WER, Fuqr dfATE, 2013 (2013 &1 18) H
GRT 469 &Y 3IUYRT (1) 3R 39URT (2) & AY 9fdd URT 73 @RI Yacd AfFaAl
H GIRT FA §U ARAT RSd dF & qry AT H&F ol (FAnst f w@@pfa)
s, 2014 # R H@MuA FE &g FAEAfaf@a @Ee gard §, srefa-

1. (1) & s & d@féicd A7 Suel (TR f FEfa) g @A, 2020
gl

(2) 2 f¥gH TS9T A FA% YU H TG F Jod gl

2. &9 (FHET $ ¥T@hfA) A, 2014 (G@ s8F s8F uEd 3 FaH &g
ar g), fage 2#, sufams (1) &, @3 (31) &, 39@s (xvii) H.-

(i) “grr a¥” el F fAU “gw I oueg W AU,

(i) TISEEOT H, @3 | H, “Adefe Afa IR dada e, affeg 3R e
HATST a@RT I A.&L.180(37) ali@ 17 ®adl, 2016” 38R, 3iehi, HIsaahl AR
weal & fav “3gder 3R HARE MR Haua fawmr qar Smd @i 127(30)
afr@ 19 wa{l, 2019 &R, 3, HIcH AR Teg W AT

3. 3%d fauaAt A, faaw 3 A, 3u-faww (3) #, fady wigs &, @ws () A, 9=
ay” eregl & o “g@ a¥” ereg TW SATE|

[B1.H.1/8/2013-Hgar.v dI3va vi]

cﬁ‘ﬁt?f"ﬂﬁﬁ

~on(9
(813X, )

ngaﬁa,mm

feoqur . Hor fAgd aranfA. d@Ear 256(37) dw@ 31 A, 2014 GaRT HRd & 9T
HEYROT, #HET 2, @S 3, 39@s () A whiRg e & 3R 3ifaw sam guus
HfOgaeT dear anaLfa. 341(31) adi@ 30 3, 2019 garT faar

LE L 3




