[TO BE PUBLISHED IN THE GAZETTE OF INDIA, EXTRAORDINARY, PART
11, SECTION 3, SUB-SECTION (i)]

Government of India
Ministry of Corporate Affairs
Notification

New Delhi, the | £ December, 2020

GSR..... (B). - In exercise of the powers conferred by section 149 read with
section 469 of the Companies Act, 2013 (18 of 2013), the Central Government
hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Companies
(Appointment and Qualification of Directors) Rules, 2014, namely:-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Companies (Appointment and
Qualification of Directors) Fifth Amendment Rules, 2020.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the
Official Gazette.

2. In the Companies (Appointment and Qualification of Directors) Rules, 2014,
inrule 6,-

(a) in sub-rule (4),-

(i) for the words “one year from” the words “two years from” shall be
substituted;

(ii) for the first and second proviso, the following provisos shall be
substituted, namely :-

“Provided that an individual shall not be required to pass the online
proficiency self-assessment test when he has served for a total period of not less
than three years as on the date of inclusion of his name in the data bank,-

(A) as a director or key managerial personnel, as on the date of inclusion of
his name in the databank, in one or more of the following, namely:-

(a) listed public company; or

(b) unlisted public company having a paid-up share capital of rupees ten
crore Or mMore; Or




(c) body corporate listed on any recognized stock exchange or in a country
which is a member State of the Financial Action Task Force on Money
Laundering and the regulator of the securities market in such member State is a
member of the International Organization of Securities Commissions; or

(d) bodies corporate incorporated outside India having a paid-up share
capital of US$ 2 million or more; or

(e) statutory corporations set up under an Act of Parliament or any State
Legislature carrying on commercial activities; or

(B) in the pay scale of Director or above in the Ministry of Corporate
Affairs or the Ministry of Finance or Ministry of Commerce and Industry or the
Ministry of Heavy Industries and Public Enterprises and having experience in
handling the matters relating to corporate laws or securities laws or economic
laws; or

(C) in the pay scale of Chief General Manager or above in the Securities
and Exchange Board or the Reserve Bank of India or the Insurance Regulatory
and Development Authority of India or the Pension Fund Regulatory and
Development Authority and having experience in handling the matters relating
to corporate laws or securities laws or economic laws :

Provided further that for the purpose of calculation of the period of three
years referred to in the first proviso, any period during which an individual was
acting as a director or as a key managerial personnel in two or more companies
or bodies corporate or statutory corporations at the same time shall be counted
only once.”;

(b) in the Explanation, in item (b), for the words “sixty percent”, the words “fifty
percent” shall be substituted.

[F. No. 8/4/2018-CL-I- Part I]

N2
12V
(K.V.R!MURTY)

Joint Secretary to the Government of India

Note: The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary,
Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide notification number G.5.R. 259(E), dated the
31st March, 2014 and were last amended vide notification number G.S.R. 589 (E),
dated the 28th September, 2020.




[ﬂm*m,mw.muu,ms,m(i)#mmﬁ]

T WFR
FRUNT FF AIEAT

Fftrgeren
75 T, 18 Rgsw, 2020

WHLA. ......(30).- T TR, 9 3w, 2013 (2013 =T 18) & 4T 469
a:muqi%?rﬂmMQmmalﬁaﬁaﬂmmga,M(ﬁaemﬁ

IR 3R 3igem) T, 2014 71 A wehew e g BT e e 2
-

1. (1)%%@%#@?%@#(@?&@%#%@%?%)%
My e, 2020 ¥

(2) 3 T H 3% GHRE N ahT ¥ gged g
2. FWeR (el # afEa R adan Baw, 2014 % e 6 A

(@) 39-fAge (4) # -
() T UF a9 gl F U W ¥ 2 av e gfaewiua fFe soa;
(ii}%ﬁﬁ?{ﬁ%ﬂgﬁ%%%%ﬁﬁf@awmmﬁﬁ,m-
WG TE B B e A o S wa-aeuiee ofeT sedhot
FEA AT AG T AR IO ser dF A 3o AW F gERes
TG F FT T aut A safr g I 4 8-
(a:)glaa#ﬁaqﬁam*mm@rmﬁuﬁﬁmmmqﬁ@
TR FAF F &7 F D@ F  uw srvar wtw F e
(*)Wmmm;m
(@TH T3 T8 30T 3 HF B Fecd RN @ A
e WA TE HUA; Jrear
(N TRl AT Tl v ser du F gehee #RORe
mmmamtmﬁﬁﬁﬁummﬂ
WH T & 3 W W o7 § Seand aoR &



Rfeams e FeieeT & sierisiT e w1 wEed )
31T
(mzmmmmmmﬁmsmsﬁ
T el T & AR e P SR s
@) 89 & @ 5 Tow B Bulrer & aRRE F e
ST ATNTSTF BrATherTs FXet ATy wifafers 9T, srepar
(@WWWW%WWWWW
mmmmwmmmﬁﬁmmmm
m%éaﬂﬂmﬁaﬂtmt%@ﬁmmﬁ%%ﬁnﬁm
aﬁmﬁﬁﬁ#ﬁdﬂamaﬁﬁmﬁamwm;
(Mmucmfa N RAfawa @ semr srder Red #F s s @
%ﬁmmﬁmmmﬁmﬁﬁ%ﬁmmﬁm
mﬁwmmmmtmﬁ,m
FARE Rt s yemfa Rt srar anfts RfE & ey
AHA P HAAT T HT 30373,

WG T IR B www wgF F welid dw af B oaEf & doer & g
mmmmmmmaama@ma:mmm
ﬁmmﬁ%ﬁmﬁmﬁﬁwﬁmﬁﬁ&&mmuﬁ@mm
F WA I R, 30 oF & I S w9 F B so

(@) FoedEmor &, 77 (W) #F, T uiNwd = F e W, “TIH GfaeT” o
W e
(FT.H. 8/4/2018-HITH-1, qré-1] O
Sy
(BAIR A |2
HgFd A, 9Ra WER

Roqor: 7w A sRa & oo, HATURYT, $WT-Il, ©S-3, 3UEs () & e
TR ALALA.259(30) aifg 31 &, 2014 AT TR T aw & sk zmer
AT HEAF ALHLE. 589(31) T 28 fader, 2020 arr 3 Hetesr My
T AT




